
Flower of Scotland Prince Charles accepts three red roses from 10-year-old 

Prince - !". , ,! - - . - I > -  .t >-. reveals he is no piper 
bnt can sing pr.aises-~f malt 
THC Prince of Wales yesterday 
revealed his favourite tipple - 
and how lie failed as a piper at  
Gordomtoun School. 

Cbatting to a group of old 
people in a new geriatric wing 
in a hospital a t  Golspie, Sather- 
land, Prince Charles told 79- 
year-old Joseph MacDomld 
that his favwrite dram was 
Laphraoig, the Islay malt 
whisky. 

To a former piping instruc- 
tor, Kenny MacRae of Dornoch, 
69, who has met several mem- 
bers of the royal family, he con- 
fessed that when he took up pip- 
ing at  Gordonstoon his tutors 
,gave him up as a failure. 

He congratulated 92-year-old 
Mary Barclay from Rogart on 
her birthday, the fipst since all 
30 patients were transferred 
last week from their tumble- 
down Cambasavie Hospital, 
near D o m h ,  to the new 
E71i0,@00 wing of the Lawson 
Hospital. 

He +sat and enjoyed me 
Rowan Tree, a romantic s a g  

sung by 98-year-old Georgina 
Baillie from Brora. 

In the general ward of the 
hospital he autographed the 
plaster of a patient who is a 
namesake of that well known 
critic of Royalty, Willie 
Hamilton (this one. from 
Golspie). And to another male 
p t ient  he gave this racing tip: 
Bet on the jockey - not the 

horse!' 
The prime's day in sunny 

East Sutkrlalad started with his 
reading the lessom in the 13th 
century D o a d  Cathedral, this 
year celebrating 758 years of 
worship, and ended with a 10- 
year old schoolgirl presenting 
him with three red roses from 
her garden. 

Donna Cowb, from the Bun- 
galow, m a r t ,  Lad travelled 
ten miles with friends to 
Golspie to get a glimpse of the 
prince, smartly dressed in kilt 
and tweed jacket. "I could not 
believe it when he came over 
and accepted my flowers," said 
the delighted youngster. 

Another little girl, four-year- 

old Sally Macas&ill, grand- 
daughter of the cathedral 
minister the Rev James Simp- 
son, made a presentation of a 
book to Priace Charles at  the 
end of the morning service 
which saw him lrnveil a plaque 
follosving tBe dedication of a 
stained ss window tlepictimg 
Bishop g b e r t  of Masy, the 
folr*. 

The prime a h  met the 
cathedral appeals committee 
w b  raised funds not only for 
the remembrance window, but 
an additional 231,708 for 
named charities. Lord Strath- 
naver, chairman of the com- 
mittee, h d e d  over 215,000 for 
deprived children in a hospital 
in Malawi, 215,060 for tbe 
c h d ' s  eventide home in 
DorPoch, and 21,700 for meat- 
ally Ldicapped children in 
Satherlad. 

In his sermon, the nyhister 
justified the "extrava~ance" of 
the church window, ' provided, 
like Jesus, we also have a con- 
cern for the poor, for those 
whose needs are greater than 
our own!' 


